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Abstract

Social impacts and other types of impacts such as economic and environmental have been studied extensively in the
tourism �eld. The main aim of this research is to understand the differences in the social impacts of tourism between
summer 2019 (pre-COVID-19) and summer 2020 (during the COVID-19 pandemic) in a coastal tourism destination from
the visitors' perspective. Data were collected using surveys carried out in the municipality of Platja d'Aro (Catalonia,
Spain) in 2019 (pre-pandemic) (n=468 visitors) and 2020 (during the pandemic) (n=394 visitors). The responses were
categorised into two main groups: “strengths and weaknesses of the destination”, in order to understand the possible
social impacts of tourism. Results show that visitor pro�le differed in terms of origin and age during the pandemic. The
level of satisfaction with the destination remains similar despite the adverse scenario caused by the pandemic. Social
impacts are identi�ed and compared between the two periods. This information can be used by tourism destination
policymakers to analyse differences in social impacts between pandemic and pre-pandemic periods.
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1. Introduction
Coastal tourism plays a pivotal role in various destinations worldwide, signi�cantly in�uencing local communities, not
solely in economic terms, but also socially and culturally (Hana�ah et al., 2021; Khundaqji et al., 2018). According to
Ecorys (2013) and Hana�ah et al. (2021), the discourse on coastal tourism is delineated by three main activities: i)
activities strictly related to the protection and enhancement of the environment; ii) activities that intensively utilise one or
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more elements of the environment as a primary resource; and iii) activities that depend on the quality of the environment.
However, this form of tourism, facilitated by increased accessibility, must adhere to sustainability principles to maximise
its socio-cultural bene�ts (Armbrecht and Skallerud, 2019; Nunkoo and Ramkissoon, 2011). Although it drives changes in
local infrastructure, such as accommodation and food and beverage services, to attract tourists (Cohen and Cohen,
2012; Ishii, 2012; Xue et al., 2017), it also presents considerable social challenges and costs.

In academic literature, there are clear examples that an excessive increase in tourist activity can lead to severe problems
at coastal destinations, such as landscape alterations, tra�c congestion, parking issues, increased crime, noise
pollution, and tensions between visitors and residents (Garau-Vadell et al., 2014; Horne et al., 2022; Jarratt and Davies,
2020). These factors negatively affect the quality of life of local populations (Timur and Getz, 2009). Additionally, other
impacts are identi�ed, associated with the saturation of public spaces, exceeding the carrying capacity of localities, and
environmental issues such as the accumulation of waste on beaches and the pollution of coastal waters (Dada et al.,
2012; Hamzah et al., 2011; Lindberg and Johnson, 1997; Sheldon and Abenoja, 2001; Zheng and Liu, 2021). These
impacts not only affect local communities but are also perceived by visitors, which can generate aversion towards the
destination and foster negative perceptions of it. In the medium and long term, this situation can deteriorate the
destination and signi�cantly reduce the economic bene�ts that tourism activity could generate. Therefore, it is clear that
coastal tourism is a delicate industry, highly sensitive to both the environment and human well-being (Elias and Barbero,
2021; Hana�ah et al., 2021; Mestanza-Ramón et al., 2019; Wedding et al., 2022; Wondirad and Ewnetu, 2019).

In this context, COVID-19 has dramatically changed tourism behaviour and created many tourism restrictions greatly
impacting societies and economies around the world, especially in countries that largely where tourism is a cornerstone
of the economy. The World Tourism Organization (UNWTO) projects a loss in international tourism revenues of between
860 billion and 1.2 trillion dollars (World Tourism Organization, 2020). In addition, between 100 and 120 million direct
jobs are at risk (UNWTO, 2021).

To date, it is clear that academic studies have been based on pre-pandemic behaviour However, researchers are aware of
the need to understand how COVID-19 affects tourism (McCartney et al., 2021) and how it has changed tourist behaviour
(Im et al., 2021) as this has profound consequences for social impacts in a destination (Ramkissoon, 2020). Such
information would provide new knowledge that can be applied in other situations where a dramatic drop in tourism might
exist (Ahmad et al., 2023; Ainuddin and Routray, 2012; Nyaupane et al., 2020; Prayag, 2020; Straub et al., 2020; Xu et al.,
2022). This research focuses on changes in tourism stemming from the COVID-19 pandemic, enabling an understanding
of tourist behaviour and of how social impacts of tourism are perceived compared to the previous year.

Therefore, the main aim of this research is to contribute to the knowledge on social impacts by comparing the impact of
tourism through the strengths and weaknesses of a destination using data from 2019 (pre-pandemic) and 2020 (during
the pandemic). The study focuses on Platja d’Aro, a coastal tourist destination on the Costa Brava, Catalonia, in the
northeast of Spain and close to the French border.

The research methodology was based on identifying social impacts by coding responses to open-ended survey
questions, where respondents were free to identify the strengths and weaknesses of a destination. Information was
obtained from a survey carried out in 2019 (pre-pandemic) and another in 2020 (during the pandemic), with 468 and 394
respondents, respectively.

The conclusions, especially those from summer 2020, must be regarded within the circumstances of the COVID-19
pandemic. The results, in terms of tourist pro�le and social impacts are suitable for comparison with previous seasons
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as the pandemic situation has had a highly signi�cant impact on tourism markets worldwide. Therefore, this is an
excellent opportunity to gather information on the development and management of destinations under exceptional
circumstances and where extraordinary measures have been implemented.

This article is structured as follows. Section 2 outlines the theoretical framework on social impacts in tourism and
COVID-19 pandemic studies in tourism. Section 3 presents the survey design, sampling, and method used. Section 4
explains and compares the results on demand pro�le and tourism social impacts between the pre-COVID-19 and COVID-
19 pandemic periods. Section 5 closes with the conclusions.

2. Literature review
2.1. Social Impact in Tourism

Tourism is considered an important development tool in destinations due to its ability to generate economic bene�ts and
sources of employment. The social impact on a territory is a complex phenomenon because it is diverse in nature and
generates changes that affect people's quality of life (Viana-Lora et al., 2022). For Hall and Lew (2009), the social
impacts of tourism are conceived as the ways in which tourism transforms social and collective value systems,
behavioural patterns, community structures, perceptions, attitudes, lifestyle, and quality of life.

Understanding the social impacts of tourism in destinations is of vital importance for tourism managers, as it enables
them to take action to reduce the likelihood of community backlash against tourists and tourism development (Deery et
al., 2012). In a tourism destination, social impacts occur as a result of social relations between tourists and people of
different cultural and socio-economic characteristics (residents), maintained during their stay in an area that is different
from their usual place of residence (Yürük et al., 2017).

It is well known that tourism can generate social impacts that bene�t or affect different population groups (Gavinho,
2016). Some of these impacts may include changes in local culture, residents' quality of life, wealth distribution and
employment, and tourists' and residents' perception of the tourism destination (Perles-Ribes et al., 2020). Since residents
are a fundamental part of tourism destinations, their attitudes and behaviour patterns have a considerable impact on a
destination’s success (Higgins-Desbiolles, 2020; Wakil et al., 2021). Hence, residents' perceptions can be a timely
indicator to measure the social impacts derived from tourism activity (Albayrak and Caber, 2018; Josiassen et al., 2022).
In this context, Mendoza et al. (2011) assert that the more attention is paid to residents' perceptions, the more likely
residents will accept tourism development initiatives. Despite this, residents' perceptions of tourism impacts are far from
homogeneous and change between different segments of the population because they are in�uenced by many variables
(Muler et al., 2018).

Although many authors have analysed social impacts based on residents' perceptions, there are few studies exploring
tourists' perceptions of the social effect tourism has on destinations they visit (Albayrak and Caber, 2018). Prayag et al.
(2020) assert that tourists may be as sensitive as residents to the negative impacts of tourism due to their personal
relationships and connections with host communities. Tourists' perceptions of impacts affect their post-consumption
behaviours, such as satisfaction, giving recommendations, and their intention to return to the destination (Prayag and
Brittnacher, 2014; Su et al., 2020).

Over the years, several researchers have identi�ed various positive impacts tourism brings to a destination (Prayag et al.,
2018; Vodeb, 2021; Woo et al., 2018). These include improved quality of life (Sharma et al., 2008), creation of new
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infrastructure and recreational facilities (Horne et al., 2022; Mamirkulova et al., 2020), improved public services (Gannon
et al., 2021), and increased leisure opportunities that are also available to the local community (Espinoza-Figueroa et al.,
2021; Scholtz, 2019). Tourism can also help stimulate community interest in the preservation of natural and cultural
resources, as these are highly valuable in the tourism experience.

Tourism has become a factor promoting cultural exchange between visitors and locals within a framework of tolerance
and well-being (Kamata, 2021; Sey� et al., 2020; Viana-Lora et al., 2022). It is a fact that tourism activity generates both
positive and negative impacts that span a range of areas. However, it is important to note that these impacts can vary in
nature and magnitude, and must be considered in a holistic manner for effective and sustainable tourism management
(Viana-Lora et al., 2022). These types of social changes affect the visitor's perception of other cultures and ways of life,
deepening understanding and respect for socio-cultural differences (Çelik, 2019). However, not all residents of a local
community bene�t from tourism, and not all have the intention of supporting tourism development in their areas. A study
by Woo et al. (2018) found that residents a�liated with the tourism industry perceive the impact of tourism more
positively than those who are not. Therefore, the more positive their perceptions of tourism development, the more likely
they are to feel satis�ed with their lives. Consequently, other authors have concluded that the decision to support tourism
is related to the social bene�ts residents reap, i.e. people who do not work in the tourism sector showed a lower
willingness to accept more tourists in the region (Muler et al., 2018).

Negative social effects in the region can also be caused by tourism activity. Haley et al. (2005) found that the negative
attitude of tourists is a main trigger for the appearance of negative social effects. Among the main negative effects are
increased noise, litter, increased tra�c, overcrowding, crime, decline of traditions, loss of local culture, increased prices
of goods and services, and lack of space in areas shared with tourists (Andereck et al., 2005; Deery et al., 2012; Muler et
al., 2018; Peters et al., 2018; Stylidis et al., 2021; Wang et al., 2021). Undoubtedly, one of the most recurrent effects in
mass destinations is the decrease in residents' sense of hospitality, also called "tourismphobia", as a result of the burden
they have to endure from overtourism (Antunes et al., 2020; Gurran et al., 2020; Mihalic, 2020). Although processes of
tourismphobia on the part of residents are evident, in some cases these attitudes can become subjective, depending on
certain scenarios. For example, Garau-Vadell et al. (2018) found that in cases of economic recession there is a
signi�cant increase in residents' support for tourism, particularly due to a signi�cant reduction in direct or indirect
income that bene�ts certain population groups. This situation could also occur in pandemic situations such COVID-19.

2.2. Covid-19 and Tourism

Tourism is facing a major crisis caused by the outbreak of the COVID-19 pandemic (Higgins-Desbiolles, 2020). According
to o�cial data, as of 16 May 2021, COVID-19 has infected more than 166 million people, of whom over 3.44 million have
died (Statista, 2021). The plummeting global tourism demand in 2020 (74%) has caused a historic drop in tourism, and
the World Tourism Organization (UNWTO) expects a loss of between 860 billion USD and 1.2 trillion USD in international
tourism receipts (World Tourism Organization, 2020). In response to the severe effects of the pandemic, governments
were forced to take urgent measures to restrict the spread of the virus, including widespread travel restrictions,
con�nement, social distancing, and border closures, among others (Ghasempour Ganji et al., 2022; Ioannides and
Gyimóthy, 2020; Palomo et al., 2020; UNWTO, 2021).

Pandemics negatively affect tourists' behaviour and mental well-being, and they may choose not to travel to other
regions until they are sure that the danger has disappeared (Abbas et al., 2021). Therefore, there is a great deal of
uncertainty in the industry, which depends on the effective treatment (mass vaccination) and adapting to restrictions to
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avoid contagion (Barreiro and Futinico, 2020), without losing sight of the impact of COVID-19 mutations on tourism
trends (Seraphin and Dosquet, 2020).

Furthermore, tourism organisations (intermediaries, transport planners and accommodation or attraction providers) have
also seen signi�cant impacts due to low or non-existent tourism demand, particularly in destinations where tourism is
the main economic activity (Abbas et al., 2021). Although some destinations began to gradually reactivate tourism, many
activities and services were marred by having to limit interaction between people and maintain strict social distancing
measures, thus running the risk of aggravating social effects due to changes in behaviour of both residents and visitors
(Fotiadis et al., 2021).

The challenge of revitalising tourism destinations is that many of them were unprepared for a high-impact crisis.
Therefore, when COVID-19 hit, it re�ected a lack of capacity of governments to implement recovery plans, with
devastating consequences (McCartney et al., 2021). The enormous impact of the pandemic on tourism destinations,
coupled with the importance of this sector for the economy, is likely to cause a historic crisis, even if the pandemic eases
(Duro et al., 2021).

2.3. Strategies for Tourist Destinations

The tourism industry is particularly susceptible to various types of crises, especially disasters that halt tourism and
seriously affect sustainability (Hu et al., 2021). However, with the COVID-19 pandemic, the focus has shifted to protection
and resilience (Prayag, 2020). Gradually reviving a destination not only re�ects a step in the recovery of communities
after disasters but also involves a series of actions to be taken before, during and after disasters that will lead to
sustainable development (Lam et al., 2016).

As the tourism industry is highly labour-intensive and cannot be sustained without people being mobile (Sharma et al.,
2021), proximity tourism and rural tourism are deemed to be the main strategies for tourism revival (Romagosa, 2020;
Yang et al., 2021). In the context of the pandemic, nearby destinations have been very popular with tourists who need to
escape from con�nement (Lapointe, 2020; Sigala, 2020).

In the context of visitors, destinations have implemented measures to revive their tourism attractiveness and increase
tourist con�dence. From now onwards, the goal of some destinations is not to increase visitor numbers but to ensure a
better and more comfortable trip, with personalised services and safer activities for tourists (Abbas et al., 2021). In the
case of services (hotels and restaurants), managers have decided to implement high quality sanitation and health
protection measures, biosecurity protocols, social distancing policies, and a reduction in the carrying capacities of their
establishments (Hu et al. 2021). Regarding the use of public spaces, tourism managers have chosen to implement social
distancing measures to prevent crowds from gathering in areas such as squares, parks, or beaches (Çelik 2019). Im et al.
(2021) state that it is highly likely that some individual preventive actions to avoid infection will persist voluntarily, even
post-pandemic, depending on people's perception of risk. Some researchers, therefore, argue that it is essential that local
actors and governments coordinate, especially in times of crisis. On one hand, local actors must rely on differentiation
strategies aimed at creating services with higher added value and incorporate knowledge, which would gain visitor trust
(Romão, 2020). On the other hand, government support is fundamental for the survival of destinations, as they are
responsible for creating policies to protect and promote tourism activities, especially in regions where tourism revenues
are a major contributor to GDP (Fotiadis et al., 2021).
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3. Material and methods
This section outlines the place of study and the main tourist �gures of the destination. The questionnaire and the
operationalisation of the questions are described. The sampling, data collection, and the method of analysis are also
explained.

3.1. Tourist Destination

The study population was Platja d’Aro (municipality of Castell - Platja d’Aro), located on the Costa Brava, Catalonia,
Spain. Over the past 24 years, the population of the municipality increased signi�cantly, particularly between 1998 (5,785
inhabitants) and 2008 (10,150 inhabitants). Currently, in 2022, the municipality has 11,757 inhabitants (Idescat, 2022), so
the number of inhabitants has doubled in the last 24 years, while in the last 10 years (from 2009 to 2021) there has been
an increase of 12%.

In Platja d'Aro there is an annual full-time equivalent seasonal population of 4,946 inhabitants (Idescat, 2021), therefore,
the population is 43.2% higher than the resident population (ETCA population / resident population). In 2021, the
destination registered a total of 31 hotels corresponding to 4,889 hotel beds and 5 campsites, which can accommodate
10,422 campers (Idescat, 2021).

3.2. Questionnaire design and operationalisation

The questionnaire was designed and agreed by the researchers together with the town council and tourist o�ce. It
contained several sections such as sample pro�le, planning and characteristics of the stay, sources of information,
motivations, satisfaction with the destination, and recommendation of the destination to family and friends. The
questions used in the study relate to tourist pro�le (gender, age and nationality), tourist satisfaction, what the tourists
most liked about the destination or found lacking.

Tourist satisfaction was measured with the question “I am pleased with my decision” on a 5-point Likert scale from 1
(strongly disagree) to 5 (strongly agree). Finally, tourists were asked their opinion regarding the strengths and
weaknesses of the destination. The questions were as follows: “What did you like most about the destination?” and
“What did you �nd lacking in the destination?” These questions were open-ended, thus allowing tourists the freedom to
give one or more features they would have liked and/or felt was lacking during their visit to the destination. Answers
were categorised according to similar concepts and topics in order to compare the two periods analysed.

3.3. Sampling, data collection and method

Sampling was carried out during two summer-high seasons: August 2019; and July and August 2020, during the COVID-
19 pandemic. In order to obtain a representative sample of different types of tourism demand, data were randomly
collected throughout the days of the week (weekdays and weekends), as well as at different times of the day and in three
areas of the municipality: the Passeig Marítim, the Eix Comercial, and the Parc d'Aro (see Figure 1). These locations were
chosen based on tourist activity at the destination. For instance, the Passeig Marítim was selected due to the high
number of beach visitors. The Eix Comercial was chosen because it is a central hub of the city, featuring signi�cant
commercial activity and tourist services. Finally, the Parc d'Aro was selected for being a highly representative shopping
and leisure centre for the city, attracting a large number of visitors.
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Fig 1. Map of Castell-Platja d'Aro 
Source: Own elaboration

Data were collected through an online survey using mobile devices, which allowed each completed survey to be sent to a
server automatically. This procedure helped reduce the number of errors compared to traditional data collection using
paper and pencil, as well as enabling periodic controls to be carried out during the data collection process. In 2020, not
using paper and pencil ensured social distancing and other COVID-19 protocols were maintained. The questionnaires
had a maximum duration of 10 minutes. The �nal sample obtained was 394 tourists in summer 2019 (August) and 468
in 2020 (July and August) during the COVID-19 pandemic.

The method of analysis involved coding the open-ended questions in the survey, about what tourists had liked or missed
during their visit in order to identify the main categories and make comparisons. By coding the open-ended responses,
relevant and meaningful categories were established from the various opinions and comments received. These
categories covered a wide range of aspects, including the evaluation of the quality of tourist services, satisfaction with
destination attractions and activities, as well as elements related to hospitality and the local environment. The
categorisation process facilitated comparisons between the studied seasons. By exploring how visitor perceptions
changed or remained constant between August 2019 (pre-pandemic) and July-August 2020 (COVID-19 pandemic), a
deeper and more contextualised understanding of the effects of this health crisis on the tourism destination was
achieved. Additionally, the coding of open-ended questions allowed for the identi�cation of emerging patterns and
relevant trends that could not be detected through traditional quantitative methods.

4. Results
This section presents the main results derived from the data analysis. It explains the demand pro�les, strengths, and
weaknesses of the destination in the two study periods. The results obtained in the pre-COVID-19 and COVID-19 periods
were compared and related to the social impacts of the destination.
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4.1. Sample description

Table 1 shows the distribution of the sample pro�le for the pre-COVID-19 pandemic and during COVID-19 at the
destination and their demographic characteristics. The data show a similar proportion of men and women in 2019, with
an increase in the proportion of men in 2020. The mean age in 2019 was 41.0 (sd=13.5), while in 2020 it was 38.1
(sd=15.4), showing more younger visitors, on average, during the pandemic year 2020. The age distribution of visitors
showed an increase in visitors aged 34 years or below during the pandemic (46.1%) compared with pre-pandemic
(33.4%).

Table 1. Characteristics of the sample pro�le

2019 (N=394) (%) 2020 (N=468) (%)

Gender

Man 190 48.2 255 54.5

Woman 204 51.8 213 45.5

Total 394 100.0 468 100.0

Age

24 or below 53 13.9 119 25.6

25-34 years 74 19.5 95 20.5

35-44 years 99 26.1 92 19.8

45-54 years 92 24.2 82 17.7

55-64 years 39 10.3 46 9.9

65 and over 23 6.1 30 9.5

Total 380 100.0 464 100.0

Min 16 16

Max 80 81

Average 41 38.1

SD 13.5 15.4

Origin

Catalonia 169 43.4 262 57.7

France 86 22.1 72 15.9

Rest of Spain 30 7.7 37 8.1

The Netherlands 30 7.7 22 4.8

UK 16 4.1 11 2.2

Belgium 14 3.6 12 2.6

Germany 11 2.8 12 2.6

Russia 10 2.6 15 3.3

Rest of Europe 11 2.8 20 2.2

Rest of the world 12 3.1 2 0.4

Total 389 100.0 454 100.0

The place satis�es my expectations 4.605 (0.658) 4.608 (1.089)
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Tourists were mainly from Catalonia, especially during 2020 when worldwide restrictions on travel were in place due to
COVID-19. This was followed by French tourists due to the proximity, and then tourists from the rest of Spain. As
expected, there were fewer visitor arrivals from traditional tourism markets such as The Netherlands, United Kingdom,
Belgium, or Germany.

In short, during the 2020 pandemic, tourists at the destination were younger and came from destinations closer to those
in 2019. In addition, Table 1 shows a high degree of satisfaction in both study periods, with a score of 4.605 in 2019 and
a slight improvement to 4.608 in 2020. Even with the uncertain situation during the COVID-19 pandemic, satisfaction with
expectations was maintained.

4.2. Comparison of destination strengths and weakness pre- and during the COVID-19
pandemic

The results are based on open-ended questions identifying what tourists liked most about the destination (strengths of
the destination) and what they felt was lacking (weaknesses of the destination), providing information on the social
repercussions of tourism in the area. Differences between the two study periods were identi�ed and classi�ed according
to the perceived strengths and weaknesses of the destination.

During the summer of 2019, a total of 331 responses were collected for the question "What did you like most about the
destination?" related to the strengths of the destination (see Table 2). Most of the respondents mentioned the beach as
their favourite attraction (50%). Following that, categories such as the weather and sun (8%), activities and leisure (8%),
and nightlife (7%) were mentioned. In smaller proportions, categories like family activities, the friendliness of the local
people, natural spaces, and the destination's gastronomy were identi�ed. The category "Others" covers responses such
as camping, beach cleanliness, safety, and the overall quality of the destination. In contrast, during the summer of 2020,
a total of 354 responses were collected about the strengths of the destination. In that year, the responses revealed a
change in tourists preferences due to the pandemic. For the visitors, the strengths of the destination were shopping
opportunities (17%), the beach (15%), and gastronomy (10%). Additionally, nightlife (8%), activities (6%), and COVID-19
safety measures (5%) were also mentioned signi�cantly. Consequently, it can be seen that tourists signi�cantly valued
the presence of shops, which implies a greater preference for shopping at the destination or engaging in activities that
allowed for social distancing, rather than opting for the traditional sun and beach tourism.
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Table 2. Categorization of the destination’s strengths

2019: pre-COVID-19 pandemic 2020: During the COVID-19 pandemic

Percentage Percentage

Beach 49.6% Shops 16.7%

Weather / sun 7.9% Beach 15.0%

Activities / leisure 7.9% Gastronomy / restaurants 10.2%

Nightlife 7.3% Nightlife 7.9%

Atmosphere 5.4% Activities / leisure 6.2%

The sea 5.4% COVID-19 measures 5.4%

Shops 4.8% Others 5.1%

Tranquillity 3.0% Family activities 4.5%

Family activities 3.0% Climate / sun 4.2%

Diversity of Services 2.7% Proximity 4.0%

People in general / environment 2.7% Natural spaces, nature trail 3.4%

People 2.4% Accommodation 3.1%

Natural spaces, nature trail 2.1% Diversity of services 3.1%

Gastronomy / Restaurants 1.5% Tranquillity / environment / atmosphere 3.1%

Other 4.2% The people 2.5%

Parking 2.0%

Seafront / nautical club 1.4%

Security 1.1%

Accessibility for the disabled 1.1%

Total 100% Total 100%

Tourists were also asked, "What did you �nd lacking in the destination?" related to the weaknesses of the destination.
This information is essential as it helps the destination understand its current situation by identifying tourists needs in
order to develop strategies for improving visitor satisfaction, which is closely related to the social impacts perceived by
residents.

During the summer of 2019, 275 comments were collected. Table 3 shows a wider range of responses compared to the
question about the strengths of the destination. No particular category clearly stands out during this period. However,
the category with the most responses was "Parking" (12%), referring to the need for more parking spaces, better access
to them, and resolving congestion issues associated with parking, especially in the town centre. Similarly, problems
related to "mobility and public transportation" (10%) were also recurrent among the respondents. In a broader sense, this
demonstrates that issues related to mobility and access to the destination are the main concerns for tourists and have a
signi�cant impact on the destination.

The following category, "Activities and Leisure" received 10% of the responses, suggesting that tourists were seeking
higher-quality entertainment options rather than simply an increased number of activities. For the category "More
Affordable Prices," (9%) tourists responded generally, but those who provided speci�c answers referred to gastronomy
and/or parking. "Tourism Control" (8% of the responses) was next, indicating concerns about destination overcrowding,
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lack of high-quality tourism, or inadequate behaviour among tourists. "Cleanliness," especially of the streets, was also
mentioned by 8% of the respondents.

In contrast, in the summer of 2020, during the COVID-19 pandemic, a total of 162 responses were categorised regarding
the weaknesses of the destination. Tourists perceived a lack of COVID-19 health protection measures (27%), citing that
certain areas lacked protocols and social distancing (conversely, Table 2 also showed positive responses regarding
COVID-19 measures). Limitations related to mobility, such as the lack of parking (24%), and tourism control or
overcrowding (10%), were also highlighted. In this latter case, tourists observed high concentrations of people in speci�c
areas and considered regulating visitor �ows important given the circumstances of COVID-19. These concerns
demonstrated that, despite the measures implemented to mitigate the spread of the virus, mobility issues and
overcrowding in certain areas of the destination remained signi�cant for visitors.

Thus, while in 2019 the beach and leisure activities were the main attractions, in 2020 tourists valued shopping and
gastronomy more, probably due to their preference for safer activities during the pandemic. In contrast, concerns about
mobility and tourism control persisted in both years. However, in 2020 signi�cant emphasis was given to COVID-19
security measures, suggesting that these were issues that required signi�cant attention by the destination to improve the
tourist experience. Thus, overall and after taking COVID-19 security measures into account, it can be seen that during the
pandemic, mobility issues remain problematic in the destination, as access to the destination is di�cult if visitors do not
have a private vehicle.

Table 3. Categorization of the destination’s weakness

2019: pre-COVID-19 pandemic 2020: During COVID-19 pandemic

Percentage Percentage

Parking 11.6% COVID-19 measures 26.5%

Mobility / Public transport 9.8% Parking 24.1%

Activities and leisure 9.5% Tourism control /Overtourism 9.9%

More affordable prices 9.1% Other 7.4%

Tourism control / Overcrowding 8.4% Cleanliness 6.2%

Cleanliness 7.6% Mobility/Public transport 4.9%

Street infrastructure 7.3% Street infrastructure 4.3%

Gastronomy 5.8% Nightlife 4.3%

Local (shops /gastronomy) 5.1% Local (shops/gastronomy) 4.3%

Nightlife 4.7% Spaces 2.5%

Tranquillity / Quietness 4.4% Activities and leisure 1.9%

Night control 3.3% More affordable prices 1.9%

Family 2.2% Tranquillity/Quietness 1.9%

Spaces 2.2%

Information/Languages 2.2%

Accessibility 2.2%

Other 4.7%

Total 100% Total 100%
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4.3. Social impacts in the destination

Results from the study on tourist pro�le and social impacts in Platja d'Aro reveal differences between the two seasons
analysed. Concerning the tourist pro�le, our �ndings show that in both periods, tourists mostly come from Catalonia;
however, during the pandemic, this market increased signi�cantly. This is due to mobility restrictions imposed during
these months, and tourists had to look for destinations closer to home. Concerning international tourists, there was a
reduction in Dutch, British, and Belgian visitors in 2020. This con�rms that con�nement measures and social distancing
altered foreign visitors’ behaviour or trust, and this is the reason they chose not to travel to far away destinations for their
holidays.

In terms of visitor age, in 2019 the majority of visitors fell within adult age groups, ranging from 35-44 years to 45-54
years. However, during 2020 (the year of the pandemic), most visitors were aged under 35.

In relation to the strengths of Platja d'Aro, results show that most visitors perceived the beach as the main strength of
the destination pre-pandemic. This was not the case during the pandemic, when visitors began to consider not only the
beach, but also local shops and gastronomy as strengths. In this case, the change in tourism social impacts in the
destination during the pandemic is evident, as tourists were looking for other types of experiences and activities to help
them cope with the pandemic crisis. Interestingly, since the pandemic, visitors attach more importance to hygiene
measures in both public spaces and accommodation, which was not the case in previous periods. Additionally, aspects
such as nightlife, recreational activities, family activities, proximity, or people are variables that visitors began to consider
as destination strengths during the pandemic, which con�rms the postulate of other researchers, who claim that the
pandemic changes visitor perceptions, prompting them to seek new experiences; consequently, this increases the
positive social impacts in the sense of trust and attachment to the destination.

In the context of destination weaknesses, there are also signi�cant �ndings. In 2019, tourists mainly perceived the
destination as somewhat expensive, with problems related to mobility regarding parking, public transportation, and
activities. However, in the pandemic period, different concerns were perceived; �rst, visitors saw COVID-19 measures as
a weakness, especially with regard to public spaces (however, the same measures were also stated as strong points for
other tourists). Second, the lack of parking is a recurrent problem in both periods, with heightened intensity during the
pandemic, when visitors are more likely to use private cars rather than public transportation. Third, visitors perceived that
the destination showed a lack of control over public spaces, and not enough was done to avoid crowds amassing, which
could lead to contagion. Therefore, based on the most relevant weaknesses detected by visitors, it is possible to infer
negative social impacts still related to mobility issues and a certain distrust of the destination stemming from the risk of
becoming infected during their trip.

Undoubtedly, the most direct and signi�cant information about impacts from the tourists' perspective is the level of
satisfaction with the destination. Despite the existence of destination weaknesses, con�nement measures, social
distancing, travel restrictions and different tourist pro�les, visitor satisfaction has remained equally high during the
pandemic as it was pre-pandemic (see Table 1). These results may indicate that the actions taken by the destination in
order to deal with the pandemic situation and ful�l the tourists’ expectations had a positive impact.

5. Discussions
The pandemic has highlighted the urgent need to adopt sustainable and resilient strategies in coastal tourism. The
experiences in Platja d’Aro underline the importance of protecting coastal and marine environments against �uctuations
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in tourism (Gössling et al., 2020; Hall et al., 2020). This calls for an integrated approach that considers both
environmental conservation and long-term economic viability. The pandemic has demonstrated that resilience is not just
about recovering from crises but also about adapting and evolving in response to changes in tourist preferences and
market conditions (Corbisiero and Monaco, 2021; Prayag et al., 2020). This paper provides a detailed insight into the
perceptions of tourists in relation to the strengths and weaknesses of Platja d'Aro on the Costa Brava, Spain.
Understanding the importance of social impacts from the tourists' view of the municipality, it was detected that the
COVID-19 pandemic signi�cantly affected the overall tourism industry, experiencing a signi�cant decrease in the number
of visitors (Higgins-Desbiolles 2020). Although tourists may show a high sensitivity towards the effects of tourism due to
the connection they establish with local communities (Albayrak and Caber, 2018; Prayag et al., 2018), the �ndings
indicated that visitors maintained their satisfaction with the municipality of Platja d'Aro, even in exceptional
circumstances such as the pandemic.

The study identi�ed several factors that contributed to visitors' satisfaction with the destination, including the quality of
accommodation, beaches, and climate. However, it is observed that while the beach was a relevant factor for tourists in
the pre-pandemic period, during the pandemic, its perceived importance decreased. Instead, visitors gave higher priority
to aspects such as commerce, perceived safety in relation to health protocols, and the quality of tourism services (Abbas
et al. 2021).

In contrast, the research results revealed that mobility-related problems, such as parking and public transport, most
negatively affected visitors. During the COVID-19 pandemic, some tourists also perceived a lack of health protection
measures and insu�cient control of tourism and tourist congestion in the destination (Gurran et al., 2020). For Müler et
al. (2018), that the negative attitude of tourists is one of the main triggers for the occurrence of negative social effects.
Therefore, visitor behaviour must be adapted to the social context of destinations to avoid inconveniencing local
residents (Fotiadis et al., 2021). Despite this negative perception of some tourists, the �ndings of this study are
particularly interesting, as it was observed that Platja d'Aro adapted to the context of the pandemic through various
measures such as the implementation of biosecurity protocols, the promotion of local and regional tourism to reduce
dependence on international tourism, and the diversi�cation of its tourism offer to attract different types of visitors
(Barreiro and Futinico, 2020; Lapointe, 2020; Prayag, 2020). In addition, the study also highlighted the importance of
government support for the survival of tourism destinations and the need for an integrated approach to understanding
and managing the impacts of tourism on these destinations (Mamirkulova et al., 2020; Palomo et al., 2020; Viana-Lora et
al., 2022).

In terms of visitor pro�le, the study found that the visitor pro�le changed during the pandemic, with a higher proportion of
domestic visitors and a decrease in international visitors (Romagosa, 2020). This change has had profound implications
for both the local economy and the community's perception of tourism. While some local businesses may have bene�ted
from domestic tourism, others, which relied more on spending by international tourists, faced signi�cant challenges.
Furthermore, the pandemic has intensi�ed the need for coastal tourist destinations to effectively manage relationships
with the local community, balancing economic needs with the social and cultural well-being of residents. This result is
consistent with the research of Sharma et al. (2021) who stated that destinations must adapt to social contexts and pay
special attention to proximity tourism as one of the main strategies to revive tourism in destinations. For Lam et al.
(2016), destinations must adapt through a series of actions that are conducive to attracting new tourist pro�les in the
event of a crisis. In this context, the study found a change in the average age of visitors, with a higher proportion of
young visitors. This indicates that during the pandemic, people under 24 years of age perceived less risk in engaging in
tourism activities compared to older people, who still faced restrictions in participating in leisure activities (Abbas et al.,
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2021). These �ndings have signi�cant implications for tourism destination management, as they suggest that
destinations must adjust to these changes in visitor pro�les to ensure their long-term sustainability (McCartney et al.,
2021).

6. Conclusions
This research analysed the social impacts of tourism in Platja d'Aro in the summer 2019 (pre-pandemic) and the summer
2020 (pandemic). This study contributes to the coastal destination management literature showing the in�uence of
positive and negative social impacts on tourists' perceptions of a destination. Our results show that in the situation of
tourism revival in Platja d'Aro, tourism pro�le, strengths and weaknesses of the destination have changed, but that tourist
satisfaction continues to be stable between pre-pandemic and pandemic periods.

Previous research is consistent with our study, as we have found that since the pandemic, tourists attribute higher value
to local holiday destinations (Yang et al. 2021). Although tourists' perceptions are not homogeneous (Muler et al. 2018),
we found a signi�cant trend for tourists to engage in more varied activities during the pandemic than pre-pandemic.
Furthermore, previous research has shown that the pandemic has affected people's wellbeing, so there is some
apprehension about travelling without �rst knowing the situation or health protection measures in place at the
destination to ensure people's wellbeing (Hu et al. 2021). In this case, one of the major requirements found, and therefore
a weakness of the destination, was related to the adoption of health protection measures, which can reduce the
con�dence of visitors and discourage them from returning to the destination.

Although the academic literature mentions that some tourism dependent territories have begun to reactivate their
activity with certain limitations (Fotiadis et al. 2021), in the case of Platja d'Aro the reactivation has been progressive,
and its policymakers have considered certain strategies that bene�ted tourism in 2020. This was con�rmed by the
respondents’ answers, as the lack of activities was not one of the main weaknesses for visitors during the pandemic
period. These results highlight the existence of a relationship between the perception of the social impacts of tourism
and satisfaction with the destination.

Regarding the current situation, the tourism industry in Spain is experiencing a notable recovery after overcoming the
challenges imposed by the COVID-19 pandemic. Despite facing signi�cant economic and geopolitical challenges, such
as in�ation and tensions arising from international con�icts, the preference for more accessible and affordable travel
has bene�ted destinations within Europe (UNWTO, 2023). In this context, the number of international tourists visiting
Spain in 2023 reached 85 million, representing an 18.7% increase compared to 2022 and a 1.9% rise over 2019, the last
pre-pandemic year (Ministerio de Industria y Turismo, 2024). This situation supports the research by García-Esteban et
al. (2023), who assert that coastal destinations in Spain remain attractive to foreign visitors, although this �ow of people
will depend on the capacity of destinations to improve the quality of their tourism offer and adapt them to the needs of
the demand.

With the increase in tourism, Spanish municipalities have been compelled to maintain regulations implemented during
the pandemic to mitigate the negative impacts of tourism, such as environmental pollution, tourist saturation, and
tourism-phobia (Galindo and Calvo, 2024). One of the measures adopted has been the control of tourist rentals (Duro et
al., 2023), while other municipalities have continued to implement health safety measures at entry points and adapt to
new traveller expectations regarding hygiene and safety (Recuero-Virto, 2023). Furthermore, tourist destinations have
considered establishing entry limits at popular tourist sites to better manage visitor �ow and reduce environmental and
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social impact (Galindo and Calvo, 2024). Another government priority has been to reduce seasonality, to avoid reliance
on tourism during a speci�c season and encourage visitors to seek new experiences during periods other than summer
(Cesar Heymann, 2023).

In addition to government measures, coastal and rural tourism in Spain has diversi�ed its activities, with an increase in
the offer of outdoor experiences (García-Esteban et al., 2023). In this context, the debate on sustainability has gained
importance, especially in the post-pandemic era. Currently, there is a change in tourist preferences towards more
sustainable options that avoid overcrowding and favour contact with nature (Fichter et al., 2023). Although sun and
beach tourism remain the most overcrowded, visitors positively appreciate the measures taken by authorities to ensure
social distancing and avoid crowding.

This study has several implications to the destination. Firstly, �ndings are in line with previous research that argues that
implementing strict health protection protocols in the destination is crucial (Im et al. 2021), even after the end of the
health crisis, as this would increase visitor con�dence. Secondly, researchers are aware of the relevance of the
government’s role in the success of the destination's tourism revival, and which will be determined by the management
and marketing policies carried out to bene�t local tourism stakeholders (Romão 2020). Thirdly, this study corroborates
the need for local stakeholders to develop differentiation strategies (Fotiadis et al. 2021), since part of the success of
Platja d'Aro has been developing tourist activities, taking health protection measures into account.

Looking towards the future, coastal tourism and marine-coastal destinations must adapt to an ever-changing
environment. The rise of proximity tourism, digitalisation, and growing environmental awareness among tourists are
trends likely to shape the future of the sector. Coastal destinations must be proactive in adapting to these changes,
developing tourist experiences that are not only economically pro�table but also socially and environmentally
responsible. The challenge will be to create a tourist offer that attracts visitors while protecting and enhancing the quality
of life of local communities and preserving natural and cultural heritage. Finally, based on this study, future research can
be aimed at governance as a central actor in reactivating tourism in a destination, as the intervention of public managers
has considerable implications, affecting the behaviour of both residents and tourists.
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